
Bro Cybi Ministry Area  Ardal Gweinidogaeth Bro Cybi  

21 May 2017 

Sunday 21 May (Sixth Sunday of Easter) 

9:15 Holy Communion, St David 

9:15 Holy Communion, St Gwenfaen 

11 Morning Prayer, St Cybi 

11 Holy Communion, St Ffraid 

12:30 Holy Baptism 

4 Offeren 

Sunday 28 May (Seventh Sunday of Easter) 

9:15 Holy Communion, St David 

9:15 Morning Prayer, St Gwenfaen 

11 Holy Communion, St Cybi 

11 Morning Prayer, St Ffraid 

12:30 Holy Baptism, St Ffraid 

Worshipping God   Addoli Duw 

Holy Communion takes place at St Cybi on 

Wednesday 24 May at 10:30am 

Coffee Mornings following the service of Holy 

Communion on Wednesday morning and on 

Saturday mornings between 10:30 and 12 

Noon 

Growing the Church  Tyfu’r Eglwys 

Our Ascension Day service takes place at 
10am in St Cybi. We will be joined by children 
from Ysgol Parchedig Thomas Ellis. 

St Cybi Committee meets on 25 May at 
11am. 

The Bible Fellowship continues on Thursday 
25 May at 6:30pm 

Thy Kingdom Come is an invitation to 
pray and invite from Ascension Day (25 May) 
to Pentecost (4 June). Please pick up a leaflet 
today! Consider which people you might like 
to pray for. Using the piece of string that is 
available might be helpful. Then work out 
which service you will invite them to on 4 
June. Each day between the Ascension and 
Pentecost, there will be opportunities for 
prayer, private or together. A resource will be 
provided. Inviting people to hear about our 
faith is part and parcel of our discipleship as 
Christians.  Thy Kingdom Come: how will you 
use the season? 

Mothers Union 

On Wednesday 24 May from 10 - 1pm there 
is a Rainbow Sale in Bangor Cathedral. All 
proceeds go to the work of MU at home and 
abroad. Look out for the Holyhead Branch on 
the ‘Orange' stall. 
 
Our next Meeting is on a Thursday 25 May as 
usual in St David’s, Morawelon. Please note 
there is a change to our programme and our 
guest will now be Mr Phil Mansfield.  

Loving the World    Caru’r Byd 

Christian Aid is the churches charity committed to 

providing aid, relief and training. Envelopes are 

available. 

Cybi Youth meets in Ynys Mon Cakery on 

Wednesday at 6:30pm 

Afternoon Tea in the garden at Rectory Cottage, 

Rhoscolyn on 18 June from 3pm-5pm. Cost £5. 

Parking signposted from the Church. Proceeds for 

Ministry Area funds.  

Raffle Tickets are available from your church war-

dens, to be drawn at the Summer Fayre on 29 

July. Please take some to sell to your family and 

friends. Cost £1 a ticket or £5 for a book of five.  

Readings for 28 May: Acts 1:6-14, Ps 68:1-10, 1 

Peter 4:12-14, 5:6-11, John 17: 1-11 

Please pray for: 

Pray for all those standing for election at this 

time, that they would do so out of a desire to 

serve. 

The Ministry of the Dean (Kathy Jones) and    

Archdeacons (Paul Davies and Andrew Jones 

Congratulations to Andrew and Elen and Philip 

and Carys on their marriages conducted during 

the last week. 

Ministry Team 

Revd Kevin Ellis—861 845 or 07535557632 and 

at holyislandvicar@gmail.com  

Revd Jane Bailey—764780 or at 

jane.r.bailey3@gmail.com 

Ministry Area Wardens: Edna Aldred and Carys 

Griffith 

Website: www.holyheadparishchurches.co.uk 

Website and Ministry Area Diary: Edna Aldred on 861 388 ednaaldred@gmail.com  

Press Notifications: Lorna Owen on 860 191 


